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Please make sure to update your drivers before using our products.



Message via SMS (SMSC)

A SMS to a mobile phone is basically send by SMSC. Within the GSM-network it takes
place via on-net SMSC. Thereby it's unimportant in which mobile network the receiver is.
 The message is activated by:
 - digital contacts (relays, motion detector...)
 - serial interface (PLC, PC, Microcontroller ...) bitserial (PLC)
 The detection system transmits the SMS to the mobile network operator. The mobile
network operator provides the SMS to the mobile phone. Optionally the detection system
dials the mobile phone to wake up" the receiver or to initiate the confirmation handling.

E-Mail notification

Do you monitor processes and upon reaching a predetermined upper/lower limit, you need
a message? Then activate in the device the limit-value-monitoring and you get this
message. Furthermore, the device also sends its state and you are always up to date.



Interface-switch for PD/PC

You have to work with more PLC-devices, but no pleasure to switch on/off? No problem,
you connect a device of the AG-Switch-family to the PLC-devices and your PD/PC and
you will be able to communicate to both PLCs. The selection which PLC you make for
AG-Switch-I via toggle switch and for the AG-Switch-II via 24V-controll input.

Communication-driver for S7-PLC

S7-PLCs and you need data in your PC or production planning system? 
 The S7-communication-drivers connect the office-world with the control-world. Be it
classic with a serial-port of the PC up to communication over the network. Thanks to
additional adapters (such as S7-LAN), controllers without a LAN connection can be
connected to the network. Nothing stands in the way of communication with an
IP-address. On your PC for Windows as a DLL-file, for Linux as an object, you have tools
where you can access the data of the controls by calling up functions such as "ReadBlock"
or "WriteFlag". Tie for e.g. the DLL into your project and your application already has
PLC-access or simply access the data with Excel and process it in Excel.



24V-supply from USB-port

On site at your system, in the middle of the field and no 24V supply for your e.g.
S7-LAN-module?
 Plug the USB power cable into a free USB-socket on the PC, connect the cable to e.g. the
S7-LAN-module and you have supplied the module with 24V and are immediately online
on the connected bus system.
 The adapter generates the required 24V DC from the 5V of the USB-interface. When
using one USB-port, a maximum of 2.5W is available.

Remote maintenance of a S7-PLC[FREEWARE without support]

You have to solve a problem in the PLC-program, but the installation is not placed
nearby? No problem, start your PG-2000-software with "option teleservice", activate your
modem and after selection intra PG-2000-software access to the PLC is possible as if
being on-site.


