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Please make sure to update your drivers before using our products.



Remote maintenance / telecontrol of PLC

Access to the connected PLC takes place by coupling via Analogue-, ISDN-, mixed
Analogue-ISDN-, GSM-, UMTS-line and also via Internet with and without
VPN-security.

Autonegotiation on RJ-45

You need ALF to connect to a reachable WLAN, but only have a patch-cable? No
problem, ALF provides "autonegotiation" and this means that he recognises a connected
cable (patch-cable or cross-over-cable) and surround the pinning according to the cable,
so a communication is possible.



Couppling ProfiNet to MPI/DP inclusive WIFI-interface

Wired or wireless communication (WIFI) via the same adapter with the respective control
Devices from the BRIDGE-family always connect a wired-network with a
wireless-network (WIFI) and a specific PLC-interface. This gives you access to the
directly connected controller via WIFI (with S7 to the entired bus) as well as to the wired
Ethernet. Of course also from wired Ethernet to WIFI and control/bus.
 Always connected to each other, all made possible by the devices of the BRIDGE-family.

Easiest configuration by included webserver

To configure ALF you dont need additional driver or special cables, you connect your PC
via LAN or WLAN with ALF and over the integrated webserver you can configure the
needed function.



Universally on machine and PLC

Remote access to all your systems, PLCs without great effort. Even triggering of actions
by setting the integrated digital-outputs or reading in the digital and analog-inputs is
possible via the Internet connection.
 Regardless of whether you use your PC with the CONNECT-software or have connected
a device from the CONNECT-family. Couplings via LTE also enable access to the
LAN-interface on the system side. No special SIM-card is required for this.
 A solution with little effort and everything within your "private" cloud.

Remote maintenance with TS-software without original TS-adaptor

You have to reach urgend your PLC via remote maintenance and have no TS-adaptor in
your company? No problem, configure with the MPI-Kabelmanager your
S7-interface-cable MPI/PPI-Kabel the mode "TS" for "remote maintenance", connect this
cable with the TS-Adapter (article number 9350-TS) with a standard modem and send it
all to your client. Now you will be able to start the connection with your TS-sofware and
solve the problem. And this all without buying a original TS-adapter.


